
AMB Consulting Group ~ Wetumpka, Alabama 

AMB Consulting Group, LLC is a leading international consultancy group providing a 

comprehensive portfolio of business and industrial consulting services as well as workforce and 

outsourcing solutions. 

Sr. Data Analyst:  

AMB Consulting Group, LLC (Wetumpka, AL) seeks a Sr. Data Analyst to be responsible for 
processing structured and unstructured data, validating data quality, analyzing, and interpreting 
trends from the data, and reporting trends to add business value.  Utilize SQL for data 
extraction, manipulation, and analysis. Monitor and maintain data pipelines that drive and 
support various business domains and analytics needs. Contribute to and assist in the day-to-
day management and improvement of Data Team operational activities. Collaborate with cross-
functional teams to gather requirements and define project objectives. Design, create, build, 
and maintain data pipelines to collating raw data from various sources and ensuring 
performance optimization. Collaborate with others in the data science team to use shared 
platforms, enterprise standards, and best practices to deliver insights and innovations. 
Responsible for analyzing new data source along with other data scientists. Ensure data quality 
and implement tools and frameworks for automating the identification of data quality issues. 
Visualize, articulate, and solve problems to make informed decisions, as well as organize and 
analyze a solution as part of a whole and its individual component to Action management team. 
Travel to unanticipated client locations throughout the U.S. 

Requirements:  

Master’s degree in Data Science or a related field, as well as 1 year of experience in information 
technology, quality engineering or computer science, including: a high-level understanding of 
the key components of our tech stack (Tableau, PowerBI, MS Power Platform, AWS, Microsoft 
Azure, Python, Git, AWX, ServiceNow, Jira or similar experience with other tools); experience 
working with Time Series Forecasting Algorithms Proficiency in Microsoft Office Suite (Excel, 
Word, PowerPoint); ability to write VBA macros for automation tasks in Excel; strong 
experience with relational databases like SQL Server, MySQL and Vertica; ability to handle 
multiple projects and deadlines in a fast-paced, team-oriented environment; and excellent 
language, communication, and organizational skills. 

Email resumes to chris.meyer@ambc-group.com. 
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